
BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Bb Clarinet 
YCL-650II 

Piccolo 
YPC-32

Bb Clarinet 
YCL-255 

Flute    
YFL-222

Oboe       
YOB-241

Tenor 
Saxophon
e 
JTS710GN
A

Bass 
Clarinet  
1430LP

Box of 10 
Clarinet 
Reeds 2.5

Box of 10 
Clarinet 
Reeds 3

Box of 5 
Tenor 
Saxophon
e Reeds 
2.5

Box of 5 
Tenor 
Saxophon
e Reeds 3

Contra Alto 
Clarinet 
L7181

Art's Music $1,666.75 $725.25 $521.45  $       496.35  $    1,725.30  $    1,066.00  $    2,199.65  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  $    5,301.80 
Lead Times 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days
Band Shoppe NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP $1,650.00 $725.00 $525.00  $       499.00  $    1,730.00  $    1,080.00  $    2,220.00  NB  NB  NB  NB  $    5,285.00 
Lead Times June June June  June  In Stock  Mar/April  NA  NA 
Sweetwater Sound $1,655.00 $721.00 $415.00  $       395.00  $    1,715.00  $    1,017.00  $    2,330.00  $         22.00  $         22.00  $         10.50  $         10.50  $    5,380.00 
Lead Times Feb Mar Feb  Feb  1 wk  Mar  1wk  1wk  1wk  1wk  1wk  2wks 
Taylor Music $1,544.00 $677.00 $406.00  $       388.00  $    1,599.00  $       998.00  $    2,066.00  $         19.49  $         19.49  $         28.49  $         28.49  $    4,848.00 
Lead Times 60 days 60 days 30 days  60 days  60 days  90 days  15 days  15 days  15 days  15 days  15 days  15 days 
Washington Music $1,541.80 $670.85 $482.35  $       388.10  $    1,595.90  $       986.45  $    2,081.35  $         19.60  $         19.60  $         28.65  $         28.65  $    5,016.55 
Lead Times MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date
Wenger NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Clarinet 
Mouthpiec
e Premiere Clarinet 

Ligature 
1R/Dark

Alto 
Saxophon
e JAS100 
gold lacq

bass 
Blarinet 
Polaris

Flute YFL-
697H

Alto Saxo 
YAS-

875EXII

Bass 
Clarinet 

JBC1000N
Flute YFL-

382

Bariton 
Sax 

EBS60-GL
Digital Sax 
YDS-150

Soprano 
Sax YSS-

475II

Bassoon 
Renard 
#222

NB NB $1,561.50 NB $3,394.15 $3,945.90 $1,737.85 $978.10 $2,456.25 $633.25 $2,224.80 $7,173.35
30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB $1,580.00 $4,950.00 $3,355.00 $3,880.00 $1,755.00 $980.00 $2,268.00 $635.00 $2,195.00 $6,455.00
May/Jun 4-5weeks June June June June June August Late June 2 months

$25.00 $21.50 $1,570.00 $6,499.00 $3,375.00 $3,925.00 $1,745.00 $1,035.00 $3,849.00 $630.00 $2,214.00 $6,699.00
1wk 1wk Apr Mar Mar May Feb 2wks Feb 30 days

$19.99 $19.49 $1,436.00 NB $3,171.00 $3,666.00 $1,595.00 $916.00 NB NB $2,062.00 $6,555.00
 15 days  15 days  15 days 90 days 60-90 days 30 days 60-90 days 60 days 60 days

$26.30 $21.80 $1,444.95 NB $3,139.60 $3,650.00 $1,608.15 $904.80 NB NB $2,057.95 $6,757.05
MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Baritone 
Sax YBS-53

Clarinet 
BC2539-2-0

Alto Sax 
Mouthpiece 

7 Gold
Piccolo PFP 

105E

Bass 
Clarinet 
YCL-221

Bb Clarinet 
YCL-450N Flute 800B

Trombone 
YSL-354S

Trombone 
YSL354G

Euphonium 
YEP-321

Tuba 
w/case EBB-

534S

Tuba 
w/case EBB-

534 Lacq
NB $822.20 NB $914.10 $2,163.15 $1,026.20 NB $913.35 NB $2,462.00 $5,130.00 $4,456.00

30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

5105.00 NM NB NB $875.00 $2,145.00 $1,030.00 1832 NM $915.00 $710.00 $2,460.00 $4,895.00 $4,250.00
June NA May October NA July September March June June

$5,197.00 $549.00 $190.00 $872.00 $2,173.00 $817.00 $1,644.00 $727.00 $561.00 $2,450.00 $5,697.00 $4,717.00
Apr 2wks 1wk June Apr Jan Apr Apr Feb

4844.00 NM $499.00 NB $797.00 $1,991.00 $808.00 NB $744.00 $550.00 $2,288.00 NB NB
180 days 15 days 90 days 60 days 90 days 90 days plus 90 days 60 days

$4,537.00 $517.60 NB NB $2,000.95 $949.25 NB $714.10 $550.70 $2,277.40 NB NB
MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Sousaphon
e w/case    

EPH-495S

Mellophone 
W/case    

EMP304S

French 
Horn Conn 
8D/Silver

Tuba 
EBB234

Tuba     
EBB226 4V

Trumpet   
ETR420

Euphonium 
EEP321

Tuba     
EBB231

Tuba 
Mouthpiece 
Helleberg 

120S
Trombone 

YSL-200AD
Trumpet 

YTR-6335S
Trombone  

TB20-L
$5,005.60 $1,015.10 $4,712.35 $2,374.65 NB $398.60 $985.00 $2,261.45 NB $704.35 $1,993.85 NB
30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$4,700.00 $965.00 $4,650.00 $2,265.00 $3,220.00 $385.00 $940.00 $2,095.00 NB $710.00 NB $2,210.00
May In Stock In Stock In Stock In Stock In Stock July In Stock May NA

$5,934.00 $1,303.00 $4,785.00 $2,405.00 $4,484.00 $402.00 $1,275.00 $2,405.00 $74.00 $560.00 $1,984.00 $3,087.00
Apr 1wk Apr Feb

NB NB $4,433.00 NB NB NB NB NB $67.99 NB D/C NB
90 days plus 15 days

NB NB $4,676.70 NB NB NB NB NB $71.25 NB NB NB
MFG date MFG date

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Trombone 
JTB1150FO

Trumpet 
YTR2330S

Trombone 
YSL-620

Euphonium 
YEP642SII

Double 
Horn YHR-

671

Mellophon
e YMP-
204M

Tuba St. 
Petersburg 

203/450

Sousaphon
e YSH-

411SWC

Tuba    
EBB431 

Gold
Sousaphon
e EPH495S

Trumpet 
ETR520S

Trombone 
w/case 
ETB829

$1,082.95 $808.85 $2,232.10 $6,280.45 $4,719.20 $1,652.15 NB $8,664.10 $4,097.80 $5,005.60 $673.15 $1,927.25
30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$1,097.00 $805.00 1995.00 GOLD ONLY $6,160.00 $4,665.00 $1,650.00 NB $8,445.00 $3,903.00 $4,700.00 $645.00 $1,825.00
NA April October April April NA NA July May May NA

$1,090.00 $561.00 $2,221.00 $6,250.00 $4,696.00 $1,644.00 $4,400.00 $8,622.00 $4,717.00 $5,934.00 $948.00 $985.00
Apr April Mar Feb Feb 2wks 2wks Apr

$997.00 $644.00 NB $5,777.00 $4,393.00 $1,545.00 $3,777.00 $8,022.00 NB NB NB NB
90 days 30 days 60 days 180 days ? 60-90 days 30 days 1 year

$1,002.10 $632.40 $2,064.75 $5,809.45 $4,075.30 $1,528.25 NB $8,014.30 NB NB NB NB
MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

lowe price no case



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Trumpet 
w/case  

STBRVO 
Bravo 
Silver

Euphoniu
m King 
2280 

legend

Timpani 
23/26/29/3

2 
hammered 

copper Timpani 
23"

Timpani 
26"

Timpani 
29"

Timpani 
32"

3.1 Octave 
Vibraphon

e 
VSWA31S

Xylophone 
kit      

LMXYLO

Cymbal Bag 
HUM-

GL526CP

Timpani 
Tuning 

Guage 20"
$957.30 $2,759.35 $16,183.85 $3,667.45 $3,870.00 $4,222.95 $4,423.45 $4,418.35 $656.85 NB NB

30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$905.00 $2,700.00 $16,220.00 $3,750.00 $3,950.00 $4,305.00 $4,505.00 $4,469.00 $713.00 NB NB
In Stock In Stock In Stock In Stock In Stock In Stock In Stock March NA

$1,834.00 $2,799.00 $16,599.00 $3,728.00 $3,969.00 $4,329.00 $4,537.00 $4,534.00 $665.00 $95.00 $287.00
2wks 3wks 2wks 2weeks 2wks 2wks Apr 2wks 2wks 2wks

NB $2,622.00 $15,333.00 $3,515.00 $3,699.00 $4,033.00 $4,222.00 $4,588.00 $636.00 NB $242.00
30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 60 days 30 days 30 days

NB $2,610.90 $15,264.35 $3,459.10 $3,650.15 $3,983.00 $4,172.15 $4,167.30 NB $55.10 NB
MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Timpani 
Tuning Guage 

26"

Timpani 
Tuning Guage 

29"
Timpani Tuning 

Guage 32"
Marimba 
MCKF43

Marching 
Bass Drum 

Stand 
YAM-RM-
MASH-B Giro LP243

Timbales  
M257B

Cymbals 
18" 

Stadium 
Series

Mallets 
ORMG55

Mallets  
F1.5 

257704
Mallets F1  

254227
NB NB NB $5,026.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

30-90 days
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB $50.00 $550.00 $370.00 NB NB NB
30-60 days 30-60 days 30-60 days

NB NB NB $5,145.00 NB NB NB $395.00 $30.00 NB NB
In Stock NA NA

$314.00 $314.00 $314.00 $5,155.00 $194.00 $35.00 $379.00 $419.00 $32.00 $18.00 $19.00
2wks 2wks 2wks 2wks Feb 2wks 2wks 1month 2wks 2wks 2wks

$242.00 $242.00 $242.00 $4,711.00 NB NB NB NB NB $20.99 $20.99
30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 15 days 15 days

NB NB NB $4,740.45 $194.90 $40.00 $463.10 $403.70 NB NB NB
MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Mallets F2  
254230

Drumsticks 
HN5A 

Nylon tip 
12 pair

Song 
Whistle 

302

Bass Drum 
Mallets 
MB1H

Marching 
Tenor 

Drums MQ-
6300

Marching 
Bells 

w/carrier 
M65S 2.5 
Octave

Marching 
Bass Drum 

Heads 
16",18",20",

22",24"

Marching 
Tenor Drum 

heads 
6",8",10",12

",13"

Marching 
Snare 
Drum 

heads 13"

Snare 
Drum 

Head 14"
Real Feel 
Practice 

Drum Pad 
12"

Timpani 
32" TP-

3332
NB NB NB NB NB $1,163.55 NB NB NB NB NB $2,311.55

30-90 days 30-90 days
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB $35.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB $35.00 NB
30-60 days 30-60 days

NB NB NB NB NB $1,190.00 NB NB NB NB NB $2,322.00
4-6 mons In Stock

$19.00 $28.00 $31.00 $36.00 $608.00 $1,181.00 NB NB NB NB $33.00 $2,300.00
2wks 1wk 1 wk Feb May 1 wk Feb

$20.99 NB $24.95 $25.95 NB NB $222.00 $111.00 $22.00 $24.00 35.99 ? NB
15 days 10 days 10 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 15 days

NB NB NB $33.15 $564.55 $1,100.95 NB NB NB NB NB $2,138.20
MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Timpani 
23" TP-

3323

Timpani 
Set TP-

3300

Timpani 
Set TP-
4300R

Timpani 32" 
TP-4332R

Timpani 
23" TP-
4323R

Latin 
Percussion 
Stand LP-

332

Latin 
Percussion 
Everthing 
Rack LP-

372

Agoga 
Mounting 

Bracket LP-
571

Tenor 
drum 
sticks 

ProMark 
TS7

Snare 
Durm 
Sticks 
DC17

Bass Drum 
Sticks 
PSMB1,2,3,4

$2,168.90 NB NB $2,728.50 $2,331.90 NB NB NB NB NB NB
30-90 days 30-90 days 30-90 days

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB $22.50 $15.99 NB
3-5 days 3-5 days

NB NB NB NB NB $169.00 $119.00 $35.00 $24.00 $15.00 NB
30-60 days 30-60 days 30-60 days 30-60 days 30-60 days

$2,180.00 $8,770.00 NB $2,745.00 $2,345.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB
In Stock In Stock In Stock In Stock

$2,158.00 $4,452.00 $5,029.00 $2,715.00 $2,320.00 $159.00 $115.00 $34.00 NB $15.00 $155.00
Feb March Feb Feb Feb 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wks 2 wks
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB $17.99 $12.99 $119.00

15 days 15 days 15 days
$2,006.25 $9,355.50 $9,355.50 $2,523.90 $2,157.05 $136.00 $96.00 $28.00 NB NB NB
MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Marching 
Snare cover 
PEA-
MDCG13

Marching 
Snare cover 
PEA-
MDCG14

Marching 
Tenor cover 
PEA-
MDCG0223

Marching 
Bass Cover 
16" PEA-
MDCG16

Marching 
Bass Cover 
18" PEA-
MDCG18

Marching 
Bass Cover 
20" PEA-
MDCG20

Marching 
Bass Cover 
22" PEA-
MDCG22

Marching 
Bass Cover 
24" PEA-
MDCG24

Concert Bass 
Drum PEA-
PBA3216

Concert Bass 
drum Stand 
PEA-
STBD32

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB $1,670.00 $725.00
June April

$89.00 $58.00 $77.00 $60.00 $60.00 $67.00 $67.00 $73.00 $1,520.00 $704.00
2 wks 2 wks 2 wks 2 wks 2 wks 2 wks 2 wks 2 wks May 2 wks

$55.00 $55.00 $72.00 $57.00 $57.00 $63.00 $63.00 $68.00 NB $660.00
15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 30 days
$57.30 $57.30 $75.70 $59.35 $59.35 $65.50 $65.50 $71.65 $1,466.65 $692.60

MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date MFG date
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Marching 
Snare Case 
1SKB-
DM1214

Concert 
snare case 
PCH-CS1314

Junior 
Marching 
Bass Drum 
w/Carrier 
PEA-
MJB2008/CX
N33

Mallet Case 
31-1914-8B-
P 19x14x8"

Xylophone 
Mallet SPYR 
SU4R POLY

5 Octave 
Marimba M-
Tech 5.0 
Padouk

5 Octave 
Marimba 
Majestic 
Black Series

16" AA 
Viennese 
Cymbals 
Sabian

18" HHX 
Symphonic 
Germanic 
Cymbals 
Sabian

9.5" Zil-Bell 
Zildjian

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB $30.50 NB NB NB NB NB
3-5 days

NB NB NB NB $30.00 NB NB NB NB $175.00
30-60 days 30-60 days

NB NB NB NB NB $7,698.00 $7,943.00 $580.00 NB NB
March/Apr In Stock NA

$169.00 $97.00 $342.00 $199.00 $31.00 $7,295.00 $16,474.00 $365.00 NB $139.00
3 wks 3 wks Feb 1 wk 2 wks Feb 2 wks 1 month 1 wk

NB NB NB NB $24.99 NB $7,777.00 NB NB NB
15 days 30 days

$187.00 NB $317.45 $289.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB
MFG date MFG date MFG date

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Square 
Accessory 
Clamp Tama 
J38 SP

Square 
Accessory 
Clamp Pearl 
PCX100

Drum Set 
Tama 
Imperialstar 
IE52C5pc

Crash 
Cymbals 20" 
Symphonic 
Viennese 
w/pads & 
Straps

Xylo Adams 
XSKV35 / 
XSKF35 
w/frame

Tromebone 
rolling slide 
dent tool 
N87A

Tubing True 
Tool mandrels 
P88MS 
complete set

AV Reciever 
VSX-LX105

Tubing True 
Tool 
Trombone 
Handels 
P88L

Portable PA 
System Bose 
L1Pro8

NB NB NB NB $2,961.60 NB NB NB NB NB
30-90 days

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB $850.00 $725.00 NB NB NB NB NB $1,100.00
30-60 days 30-60 days 30-60 days

NB NB $750.00 $460.00 $3,035.00 NB NB NB NB NB
NA NA In Stock

$44.00 $39.00 $729.00 $475.00 $3,010.00 NB NB NB NB $1,299.00
1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk
NB $31.99 NB NB $2,777.00 $229.00 $1,549.00 NB $119.00 NB

15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days
NB $31.75 NB NB $2,793.35 NB NB NB NB NB

MFG date MFG date
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Microphone 
Shure SM57

Microphone 
Chord XLR20-
25ft CMK-
025AU

Mircrophone 
Stand K&M 
252

Microphone 
wind screen 
Shure A2WS

Tubing True 
Tool 
Trombone 
Handels 
P88S

Repairs 
$10,000

Color Guard 
Rifte 60611

Color Guard 
Padded Bag 
60121

Color guard 
Flag Bag 
58116

Clarinet 
reeds 
Vandoren 
Size 3 Box of 
10

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB $42.75 $29.95 $27.95 NB
3-5 days 3-5 days 3-5 days

$98.00 23.00 SUB $130.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
30-60 days 30-60 days 30-60 days

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$76.00 $31.00 $82.00 $15.00 NB NB NB NB NB $23.00
1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk

$82.00 NB NB NB $499.00 NB NB NB NB $19.49
15 days 15 days 15 days
$85.10 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB $19.60

MFG date MFG date
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Bass Clarinet 
Reeds 
Vandoren 
Size 3 box of 
5

Alto 
Saxophone 
Reeds 
Vandoren 
Size 3 Box of 
10

Tenor 
Saxophone 
Reeds 
Vandoren 
Size 3 box of 
5

Baritone 
Saxophone 
mouthpiece 
Vandoren 
Optimum 
Series

Baritone 
Saxophone 
Ligature 
Rovner 
Versa X Gold

Bass Clarinet 
Ligature 
Rovner 
Versa X 
Nickel

Bass Clarinet 
Mouthpiece 
Vandoren 
BD5

Alto 
Saxophone 
Mouthpiece 
Vandoren 
Optimum 
Series

Alto 
Saxophone 
Ligature 
Rovner 
Versa X MPC 
Nickel

Bb Clarinet 
Ligature 
Rovner 
Versa X 
Nickel

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$20.00 $29.00 $24.00 $235.00 $50.00 $50.00 $164.00 $118.00 $50.00 $50.00
1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk

$18.49 $24.99 $18.49 $204.99 $54.99 $44.99 $146.99 $104.99 $44.99 $44.99
15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days
$18.40 $25.05 $18.20 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

MFG date MFG date MFG date
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Bb Clarinet 
Mouthpiece 
Vandoren 
M12

Clarinet 
Mouthpiece 
Vandoren 
B45

Alto Saxo 
Mouthpiece 
Meyer G 
Series model 
6

Trumpet 
mouthpiece 
YAC11B4

Trombone 
mouthpiece 
Bach 5G

Trombone 
mouthpiece 
Bach 4G

Horn 
mouthpiece 
Laskey 80G 
U.S.

Horn 
mouthpiece 
Laskey 80G 
E.U.

Tuba 
Mouthpiece 
Bach 18

Tuba 
Mouthpiece 
Conn-Selmer 
Helleerg 
120S

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$93.00 $86.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB
In Stock In Stock
$96.00 $89.00 $145.00 $37.00 $60.00 $60.00 $85.00 $85.00 $91.00 $98.00
1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk

$84.99 $77.99 NB $34.99 $58.99 $58.99 NB NB $74.99 $66.00
15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days 15 days

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Microphone 
Sennheiser 
E935

microphone 
Stand K&M 
252

XLR-3 cords 
10ft

XLR-3 cords 
20ft

Tuner 
Donnor DMT-
01

Marching 
Bass Drum 
Lyres DEG 
A16-HC245

Flip Folder 
Plastic 5885

Drill Software 
Pyware 3D 
Professional

Drum Set 
Cart Pyle 
DSC400

Double 
Conductor 
Podium 
Wenger SKU 
1110302

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB $21.95 $6.50 NB $1,149.00 NB
3-5 days ? Immediately

$195.00 $130.00 $20.00 $23.00 NB NB NB NB NB NB
30-60 days 30-60 days 30-60 days 30-60 days

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

$162.00 $82.00 $10.00 $15.00 NB $10.00 $7.00 $954.00 NB NB
1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk 1 wk
NB NB NB NB NB $12.99 $5.25 NB NB NB

15 days 15 days
NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB

NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB NB $2,309.45
4 wks



BID REQUEST 24-05 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC.  BID TABULATION FORM

BIDDERS
Art's Music
Lead Times
Band Shoppe
Lead Times
Leitz Music  5%LP
Lead Times
Playground 3% LP
Lead Times
Sweetwater Sound
Lead Times
Taylor Music
Lead Times
Washington Music
Lead Times
Wenger
Lead Times

Key: 
Pink Awarded
NB = NO BID
Yellow under item SUB 
instrument
Green 5% local preference
Blue 3% Local Preference

Music Sorting 
Rack 
Wenger 
Mapel with 
doors

Service/ 
Repair/ Refur 

per hr
NB NB

NB NB

NB NB

NB 75.00/HR
1-2weeks

NB VARIES

NB NB

NB NB

$2,154.65 NB
5 wks
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