OPENING

BID REQUEST # BID DESCRIPTION DATE
| 20-03 I | Interactive Boards & Flat Panel TVs... ] | 11/22/19 I
51 ea 1 ea-View 72 ea-Vizio
Bidders Interactive Sonic Mobile | D-Series 32” TOTAL
Touch Screen | Trolley Stand | Flat Panel TV COST
Boards
1. $3155. 1. $775. 1. $168 1. $175,306.
AD Solutions 2. $3872. 2. $775. 2. $168. 2. $210,343.
Audio Fidelity Comm. $2879 $425 $220 $158,504
$3040 $350 $2254 $171,590
Clary Business Machines
$5614 $799 $208.99 $306,160.28
Hypertec Direct
Kynetic Technologies $3699 $449 $213 $204,434
Mobile Advance Inc. $4399 $570 $199 $239,247
Neobits Inc. $4711.29 $619.01 $161.32 $252,535.34
PCMG $4771.88 $602.45 $201.75 $258,494.33
Troxell Communications $3067 $260 $351 $181.949
Visions of Video $4497.71 $668.91 $193.77 $244,003.56
School Specialty NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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